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LABOUR LAW 

Regulating Smart-Working 

On 3 November 2016, with 173 votes in favour and 53 abstentions, Italy’s Senate approved, after nearly a 
year of debate, bill no. 2233 containing "measures for the protection of the self-employed and to promote 
smart-working for employees".  

The twenty-two articles of the bill will affect more than two million self-employed individuals and consultants 
and will introduce a series of new measures in their support; but above all, it finally sets out the legal 
framework of remote working.  

In an increasingly changing business environment, the proposal defines, for the first time, "Flexible Working", 
otherwise called “Smart-Working": a flexible way of working, made possible through digital technology. Not a 
new type of employment contract, but a different way of performing the working activities, freed from specific 
locations and working times, bound only by the daily and weekly working time limits provided under the law 
and relevant collective agreements. 

By affirming that work can be carried out partly at the business premises and partly elsewhere, employees 
who provide services that do not require their physical presence in the company or any special equipment, will 
be able to achieve a better work-life balance. At the same time, smart-working will help companies increase 
their competitiveness through a number of benefits: reduction of facilities to be provided and fixed costs, 
reduction in travel allowances, increased employee productivity and reduction in corporate absenteeism. 

The bill approved by the Senate indicates the specific agreement between the employer and the employee as 
the source of the actual ways to implement flexible working. In particular, such agreement will have to set out 
rest times, the technical and organisational steps to be taken to ensure that the worker actually logs off from 
his IT equipment as well as the monitoring procedures, in accordance with art. 4 of the Statute of the Workers. 
The agreement may be open or fixed term; in the former, the parties may withdraw with 30 days’ notice; in 
case of the latter, parties can withdraw only if there is a just cause. 

The remuneration and benefits of the smart-worker must be equivalent to those of the employees performing 
the same duties, but at the company’s premises. 

The bill clarifies the uncertainties concerning accidents at work and recognizes the inclusion within such 
category of accidents during the travel to the workplace, even if the choice of the workplace is based not only 
on the requirements related to type of work to be carried out, but also on the employee’s reasonable needs to 
combine these requirements with his or her commitments outside work. 

Regarding safety at work, the employer will be required to deliver to the employee (and the Health and Safety 
representative), at least annually, a written notice that identifies both general and specific risks to the work 
carried out by the employee outside the business premises. 

The "Jobs Act for the self-employed" will now be subject to the scrutiny of the Chamber of Deputies; the 
Government hopes to get final approval later this year so that the new rules can take effect from January 
2017. 

In the meantime, collective bargaining agreements have already implemented, although still in limited cases, 
forms of Smart-Working, either by express reference to the flexible working model (see: National Collective 
Bargaining Agreement: Food Industries of 5 February 2016; National Collective Bargaining Agreement: 
Cleaning services - cooperative system of 15 March 2016), or by simply addressing issues of flexibility at 
work. 

Apart from this first attempt to regulate flexibility, therefore, it is already possible to implement smart-working: 
there are already implementation cases being introduced through collective agreements, following specific 
agreements with the unions.  
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Smart-working, therefore, while not yet officially regulated by the law, has already been implemented in 
practice: according to a study by the Milan’s Politecnico of October 2016, there are already about 250,000 
workers (i.e. 7% of the total of employees, executives and managers) working flexibly in terms of place, time 
and equipment, and currently, smart-working in Italy, despite the lack of regulatory framework, is in place in 
30% of large businesses 
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